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Stephen is a specialist in the craft of the digital and is an 
acknowledged leader in the fields of19th century 
photomechanical printing processes, ink and 3D printed 
ceramics. He has an exemplary 20-year track record of 
publications and exhibitions and his research is highly-cited by 
academics, research councils and in policy reports, and widely 
disseminated through international academic conferences. His 
expertise is sought by advisory groups, research councils and 
other prestigious bodies and Hewlett Packard sponsor his 
Chair of Fine Print, in recognition of his understanding of the 
totality of the print industry. Stephen was the instigator of the 
IMPACT Multi-Disciplinary Print Conference series and 
chaired the conference until 2016  He has pioneered the 
reappraisal of old print technologies to understand and 
influence an interdisciplinary approach to research into digital 
print processes which is clearly defined from a user 
perspective. 
 
Central to all the pure and applied research undertaken is a 
correlation of the technology as a tool and the craft skills and 
material understanding required by the user, in order to obtain 
the highest quality and functionality of any process. His 
previous research into 3D printed ceramics and wide format 
printing have led to process patents that have been 
commercially exploited. 
 
	


